
RUBIK’S STUDIO.
88 GRINDLEFORD DRIVE, BALCATTA

Named after the creative studio where Mr 
Puzzle Cube himself, Erno Rubik, did his best 
work, Rubik’s Studio is a retro home with 
some surprising twists and turns. A display 
that defiantly thinks outside the cube, Rubik’s 
Studio reworks 70s stylings to produce a 
contemporary home that’s big on comfort. 

Just like the cube itself, Rubik’s Studio 
is deceptively simple, with the square, 
symmetrical layout only hinting at the curved 
intricacy of the overall design. The end result? 
A home that challenges convention and 
rewards creativity — one turn at a time.  

Rubik’s Studio is a uniquely edgy design with 
an easy connection to the outdoor space. 
The entire home has been designed to be 
open to the outside, wherever you are.  

Curved walls soften the edges of Rubik’s 
Studio, which has an abundance of 
comfortable living areas over the two floors. 
On the ground floor, there’s even a self-
contained guest suite with views to the 
backyard.  

Head up the feature concrete staircase and 
you’ll find three more beautiful bedrooms, 
plus a decadently comfortable living area. 

Designed to work well on a squat, square block, 
Rubik’s Studio is a nostalgically comfortable 
home that makes all the right moves. 

DEFIANTLY THINKS OUTSIDE THE CUBE.
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Block Width 12.5m
Total Area 308.56m2


